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Village of Aberdeen - Water Treatment Facility
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Prepared By:  Kendra Snyder, P.E.
Revised By:  

Description Unit Quantity Unit Price Estimated Cost

GENERAL (Structural and Site) LUMP 1.0             $540,000.00 $540,000.00

WATER TREATMENT EQUIPMENT LUMP 1.0             $915,000.00 $915,000.00

Subtotal: No Bid Subtotal: $1,597,000.00 Subtotal: $1,835,244.00 Subtotal: $1,738,000.00 Subtotal: $1,832,000.00

ELECTRICAL LUMP 1.0             $110,000.00 $110,000.00

MECHANICAL / PLUMBING LUMP 1.0             $25,000.00 $25,000.00

Total Probable Cost of Construction: $1,590,000.00 TOTAL BID: $1,648,000.00 TOTAL BID: No Bid TOTAL BID: $2,039,350.00 TOTAL BID: $1,938,000.00 TOTAL BID: $2,065,000.00

Date: 10-20-11    Revised: 

05691A State Route 15

Bryan, Ohio
(419) - 636 - 8434 (fax)

(419) - 636 - 2585 (voice)

ENGINEERS BID TABULATION

P.O. Box 565

e-mail:  kreamer@bellengineeringlimited.com

Village of Aberdeen
Aberdeen,  Ohio

Revised By:  Dennis M. Bell, P.E., P.S.

ENGINEERING  SURVEYING  PLANNING  DESIGN
Bell Engineering Ltd., Inc.

Prepared By:  Kendra Snyder, P.E.

Project
Village of Aberdeen - Water Treatment Facility

$915,000.00

200,000.00

33,000.00No Bid

$915,000.00

$175,000.00

$25,000.00

$915,000.00

No Bid

No Bid

$915,000.00

No Bid

No Bid

$915,000.00

No Bid

$823,000.00 $917,000.00

Sunesis Construction Winelco, Inc.Shinn Bros. Inc.
DER Development 

Company, LLC.
Dugan & Meyers Const. 

Co.

$682,000.00 $920,244.00No Bid

e-mail:  kreamer@bellengineeringlimited.com

BUILDING & SITE 

P.O. Box 565
Bryan, Ohio

(419) - 636 - 8434 (fax)
(419) - 636 - 2585 (voice)

ENGINEERS OPINION OF PROBABLE CONSTRUCTION COSTS
Bell Engineering Ltd., Inc.

ENGINEERING  SURVEYING  PLANNING  DESIGN
05691A State Route 15


